
Mini LED
Beamer TX-113



Multimedia
player

Projection size
32" to 176"

2 watts
stereo speakers

LED lifetime
40.000 hours

fan noise
max. 54dB

Remote
control

Mini LED
Beamer TX-113



Mini LED Beamer TX-113 Compatibility
TV box
PC/Notebook
Smartphone
Game console
Amplifier�



Mini LED Beamer TX-113
AV signal cable,
Remote control
HDMI cabel
Power cable
User Manual

Package Contents:�







High Quality 
Resolution

This LED small projector has 
native resolution of 800x480 
and 2000:1 contrast ratio. It 
supports HDMI devices up to 
1080p and VGA input up to 
1024x768. The LED lifetime 
up to 40000 hours ensures 
long life span. With a screen 
size up to 176'' it provides 
vibrant image and wonderful 
movie experience.

Manual Focus 
Adjustment

Tired by moving HD 
projector back and forth to 
adjust the screen size? Our 
projector has screen 
zooming, which allows you 
adjust the picture in any 
environment. 

Multiple Connection

It’s easy to operate with 
many ports like AV input, 
HDMI, VGA, USB, Micro SD 
interfaces. It supports wide 
variety of device includes 
but not limited to laptop, 
computer, X-Box, TV Box, 
PS3/4, etc.

Low Noise & Remote 
Control

Efficient cooling system, 
strongly decrease the noise 
of the fans. Advanced 
built-in stereo surround 
speakers are offering 
excellent sound quality. This 
film projector also equipped 
with Remote Control 
function. 






